
Appendix A

Extract from Articles of Association

Admission of Members and cessation of Membership

The Members of the Company shall be divided into "A" Members and "B" Members. "A" 
Members and "B" Members will have the rights as specified in these Articles.

The subscribers shall be the first Members of the Company and shall be designated as "A" 
Members. 

The Members may admit any other Public Body to Membership on receiving:
 a written application confirming that it agrees to be bound by the provisions of the 

Articles; and
 where a Members' Agreement has been entered into, a signed deed of adherence 

to the Members' Agreement 
from any such body.  

A Member admitted under article 12.3 above shall be designated as an "A" Member or a 
"B" Member by the "A" Members upon admission. 

A Public Body shall only be admitted as an "A" Member if they agree to ensure that at 
least 50% of the total procurement for that body of dwellings to support the discharge of 
that body's statutory responsibilities for homeless households or those at risk of 
homelessness (excluding nightly paid properties or properties outside of the London area) 
is to be procured by the Company. 

A Public Body admitted to Membership who does not agree as per article 12.5 but will 
receive services from the Company will be admitted as a "B" Member.

The rights powers and obligations of each Member under these Articles shall take effect 
on the admission of that organisation to Membership. 

Each Member shall nominate a person to act as its representative in the manner provided 
in Section 323 of the Act. Such representative shall have the right on behalf of the Member 
to attend meetings of the Company and vote thereat and to exercise all rights of 
Membership on behalf of the Member.  The relevant Member may by written notice to the 
Company revoke the nomination of such representative and may nominate another 
representative in his place.  

The rights of each Member shall be personal and shall not be transferable and shall be 
exercisable only by the Member or its Voting Representative.  

Membership shall not be transferrable.

An "A" Member shall cease to be a Member of the Company if (i) it serves no less than six 
months' written notice to do so or (ii) is removed or expelled for any reason by ordinary 
resolution of the Members passed at a General Meeting or under any agreement entered 
into between the Members from time to time and (iii) if at any time the Member ceases to 
be a Public Body or (iv) otherwise in connection with these Articles and the noting of the 



cessation of Membership in the Company's register of Members shall be conclusive in this 
regard

A "B" Member shall cease to be a Member of the Company if (i) it serves no less than six 
months' written notice to do so or (ii) is removed or expelled for any reason by ordinary 
resolution of the Members passed at a General Meeting or under any agreement entered 
into between the Members from time to time and (iii) if at any time the Member ceases to 
be a Public Body or (iv) otherwise in connection with these Articles and the noting of the 
cessation of Membership in the Company's register of Members shall be conclusive in this 
regard.

At the end of each financial year, the "A" Members shall each confirm to the Company (in 
a form that shall be agreed by the "A" Members from time to time) the percentage of its 
total procurement for that "A" Member of dwellings to support the discharge of its statutory 
responsibilities for homeless households or those at risk of homelessness (excluding 
nightly paid properties or properties outside of the London area) that was undertaken via 
the Company that financial year. In the event that this percentage is less than 50% the "A" 
Members have, at their discretion, the ability to terminate the "A" Member's Membership in 
accordance with article 12.14.

The decision to terminate an "A" Member's Membership in accordance with article 12.13 
shall be taken at a meeting of the "A" Members (i) called on no less than 7 clear days' 
notice; (ii) attended in person or by proxy by at least 50% of the "A" Members (excluding 
the "A" Member whose Membership is being considered for termination); and (iii) made by 
no less than 50% of the total "A" Members excluding the "A" Member whose membership 
is being considered for termination. 

In the event that an "A" Member's Membership is terminated pursuant to article 12.14 the 
Membership shall terminate immediately upon the decision having been taken. 

In the event that an "A" Member's Membership is terminated in accordance with article 
12.12 that Member may be re-admitted to the Membership of the Company as a "B" 
Member, subject to compliance with article 12.3 and 12.6.


